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THE APPARENT PROBLEM: 

Michigan is one of a handful of states that continues 
to require out-of-family adoptions to be made 
through an adoption agency. Under the traditional 
model, a biological parent relinquishes a child to an 
adoption agency, which then, using its own 
standards and employing the results of its 
evaluations of prospective adoptive parents, chooses 
the adoptive parents and sees the process through 
the probate court; typically, birth parents do not 
know where a child was placed, nor do adoptive 
families know where a child came from. That 
model was originally meant to guard against baby 
brokering and exploitation of children, plus protect 
the privacy of the parties and assure the integration 
of the adoptee into the adoptive family. However, 
it has increasingly been viewed as antiquated and 
unnecessarily restrictive. 

While severing all ties with a biological family was 
once viewed as an element in affirming the 
adoptee's membership in the adoptive family, more 
recently openness in adoption has been viewed as 
an emotionally healthy alternative, allowing birth 
families, adoptees, and adoptive families to prevent 
or answer emotionally-charged questions raised by 
an adoption--such as why the child was put up for 
adoption, and what later became of him or her. 
Open adoptions also make it easier for adoptive 
parents to obtain medically important information 
about a birth family. 

Michigan law does not forbid an adoption from 
being conducted through an agency with a degree of 
openness, but neither does it provide any assurances 
that birth and biological parents will be able to 
shape an adoption with the degree of openness that 
is mutually agreeable, whether that be anything 
from complete mutual anonymity to continued 
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contact after the adoption is final More to the 
point, many birth parents are reluctant simply to 
hand over their children to an adoption agency, with 
no guarantee that their preferences in adoptive 
parents will be honored. Adoptive parents are 
frustrated by long waiting periods and seemingly 
arbitrary agency criteria--criteria that may have 
more to do with limiting an agency's pool of 
applicants than determining parental fitness. 

The result is that birth parents and adoptive parents 
are leaving Michigan to carry out direct placement 
adoptions in other states, where birth parents may 
exercise greater control over the placement of their 
children, and adoptive parents may have greater 
access to adoption. It has been proposed that 
Michigan, too, allow direct placement adoptions 
accompanied by certain procedural safeguards, while 
continuing to allow agency adoptions for those who 
prefer that alternative. 

THE CONTENT OF THE BILLS: 

The bills constitute a package of legislation that 
would authorize direct placement adoptions in 
which a parent or guardian chooses the adoptive 
parents, with or without the assistance of an 
adoption agency, and subject to the approval of the 
probate court. The bills also would provide for 
children to be placed temporarily with prospective 
adoptive parents prior to formal court placement. 
Expenses that could be paid by prospective adoptive 
parents would be detailed, and greater detail and 
emphasis would be given to requirements for the 
compilation and maintenance of nonidentifying 
information on adoptees. (Note: the bills are 
meant to form a package, but tie-bar provisions in 
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House Bills 4200 and 4429 would have to be 
amended to effect that aim.) 

House Bill 4200 would amend the adoption code 
(MCL 710.22 et al.) to authorize direct placement 
adoptions subject to the approval of the probate 
court. Prior to formal court-approved placement, a 
parent, guardian, or adoption agency ("child placing 
agency'' in the statute) could temporarily place a 
child with prospective adoptive parents following a 
preplacement assessment conducted by an adoption 
agency. Adoptive parents would be explicitly 
allowed to pay for various services and expenses 
connected with the birth of the child and the 
adoption, including medical expenses, counseling, 
and legal representation for the birth parents. A 
more detailed explanation follows. 

Direct placement. In a direct placement, a parent 
or guardian would personally select a prospective 
adoptive parent. The selection could not be 
delegated, but a parent or guardian could obtain 
assistance in locating or evaluating a prospective 
adoptive parent, subject to the bill's restrictions on 
payment of expenses and solicitation of biological 
parents for adoptive children. The prospective 
adoptive parent, his or her attorney, or a person 
assisting the parent or guardian would provide 
certain information about a prospective adoptive 
parent before the child was placed with the 
prospective adoptive parent. That information 
would have to include the information contained in 
the preplacement assessment required by the bill, 
and could include additional information desired by 
the parent or guardian, but would not have to 
include identifying information. The parent or 
guardian and the prospective adoptive parent would 
decide whether to exchange identifying information 
and whether to meet. 

Temporary placement. Temporary placement would 
be a transfer of custody of a child to a prospective 
adoptive parent prior to court-approved formal 
placement. It could be done by a parent or 
guardian in a direct consent adoption, or by the 
agency in an agency adoption. Generally, if a child 
was temporarily placed with a prospective adoptive 
parent under the bill, the prospective adoptive 
parent could consent to all medical, psychological, 
educational, and related services for the child; the 
parties could, however, make alternative 
arrangements. Temporary placement would only be 
allowed if the prospective adoptive parent was a 
Michigan resident who agreed to reside in Michigan 

with the child at least until a change of residence 
was approved by the court after formal placement 
occurred. 

That pledge would be part of a written document in 
which the prospective adoptive parent also attested 
to understanding that the temporary placement 
would not become a formal placement until the 
parents consented or released their parental rights 
and the court terminated parental rights and 
approved the placement. Within 30 days of a 
temporary placement by a parent or guardian, the 
prospective adoptive parent would have to report to 
the court that either a petition for adoption had 
been filed, or the child had been returned to a 
parent or other person having legal custody. When 
an agency made a temporary placement, it similarly 
would have to report to the court. 

The parent, guardian, or adoption agency would 
have to sign a statement documenting the transfer 
of custody and confirming that the person making 
the transfer had read a favorable preplacement 
assessment of the prospective adoptive parent 
completed or updated within the past year. Even if 
only one parent was making the placement, the 
document would have to include the names and 
addresses of both parents, including the name and 
address of the putative father, if known, of a child 
born out of wedlock. 

Each document required for temporary placement 
would have to be witnessed by one of the following: 
a hospital employee designated by the hospital 
administrator, an attending practitioner, a probate 
court register, an attorney, or an employee of an 
adoption agency. 

Within 48 hours after custody was transferred under 
a temporary placement, the witness would have to 
report the transfer to the court, providing details 
and documents as prescribed by the bill. If, 45 
days after custody had been transferred, the court 
had received no report of a petition for adoption 
being filed or custody being returned to the parent 
or guardian, the probate register immediately would 
investigate. If neither disposition had occurred, the 
register immediately would notify the prosecutor, 
who immediately would file for a custody hearing in 
the probate court. 

Preplacement assessments. An individual seeking to 
adopt could request a preplacement assessment at 
any time; he or she could request more than one 
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preplacement assessment, and could request that an 
assessment in progress not be completed. A 
preplacement assessment could only be conducted 
by an adoption agency. In an agency adoption, the 
agency could require a prospective adoptive parent 
to be assessed by its employee, even if the individual 
had already received a favorable assessment from 
someone else. At the discretion of the court, a 
preplacement assessment could be used to meet the 
statutory requirement for investigation of a 
prospective adoptive parent who has filed an 
adoption petition. 

Preplacement assessments would have to be based 
on personal interviews and visits at the homes of 
prospective adoptive parents, and would have to 
cover various aspects of the person being evaluated, 
including the following: age, ethnicity, and religious 
preference; marital and family status, including the 
presence of any other children in the household; 
physical and mental health, including any history of 
addiction to alcohol or drugs; educational and 
employment history, and any special skills or 
interests; financial status; reason for wanting to 
adopt; any previous requests for assessments or 
involvements in adoptive placements; whether the 
person had ever been the subject of a domestic 
abuse or child neglect proceeding, and the outcome 
of that proceeding; whether the person had ever 
been convicted of a crime; whether the person had 
located a parent interested in placing his or her 
child with the person, together with a brief 
description of the parent and the child; and, 
anything that raised a specific concern about the 
person's suitability as an adoptive parent, including 
the quality of the home environment, the 
functioning of other children in the household, and 
any aspect of the individual's circumstances that 
may be relevant to a determination that the person 
was not suitable. (A "specific concern" in this last 
context would be one that suggested that placement 
of any child or a particular child in the home would 
pose a risk of physical or psychological harm to the 
child.) A preplacement assessment also would have 
to include a criminal history check, and a list of 
sources on which the assessment was based. 

An unfavorable assessment or one that differed 
from the conclusion of an earlier assessment would 
have to include a justification of its conclusions. A 
person could ask the court to review an unfavorable 
assessment, and if the court found by clear and 
convincing evidence that the assessment's conclusion 
of unsuitability was not justified, the parent or 

guardian could place the child with the individual. 
If the court determined that the unfavorable 
assessment was justified, it would order that the 
child not be placed with the individual. 

Foster parent adoptions. If the prospective adoptive 
parents had been the child's foster parents for at 
least 18 months, the court could waive the full 
investigation otherwise required by law. The foster 
care home study, with information added as 
necessary to update or supplement it, could suffice. 

Custody hearings. The bill would provide for 
custody hearings in the probate court in temporary 
placement situations where a prospective adoptive 
parent refused to return a child to the parent, 
guardian, or adoption agency; where a prospective 
adoptive parent was either unwilling or unable to 
proceed with the adoption; where an adoption 
agency was unable to proceed because the parent or 
guardian was unavailable or unwilling to execute a 
release; or, as described above, where the 
prosecutor became involved because the 45-day 
deadline for action had not been met. 

The court would have a number of alternatives, 
depending on circumstances: it could order the 
child returned to the parent, guardian, or adoption 
agency; it could appoint an attorney to represent the 
child or refer the matter to the Department of 
Social Services (DSS) for proceedings under the 
neglect provisions of the juvenile code; it could 
appoint a guardian as requested by a prospective 
adoptive parent or another individual interested in 
the welfare of the child; or it could make a 
temporary disposition under the juvenile code. The 
court could appoint a guardian ad !item for the 
child or a minor parent of the child. 

Releases and consents. Under current law, when a 
child is given up for adoption through an adoption 
agency or the DSS, the parent or guardian executes 
a release; a consent is a consent to adoption by a 
specific individual. Parents may not at present 
execute consents except for in-family adoptions; in 
conjunction with providing for direct consent 
adoptions, the bill would delete this prohibition. 

The probate court would have to hold a release or 
consent hearing within seven days after it was 
requested. A release or consent by a parent or 
guardian would have to be accompanied by a 
verified statement that confirmed all of the 
following: that the parent or guardian had received 
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a list of support groups ( and, if applicable, other 
information from the adoption agency); that the 
parent or guardian understands that he or she may 
receive psychological counseling and whether he or 
she has received any; that the parent or guardian 
has not received or been promised anything of value 
except for lawful payments itemized on a schedule 
filed with the court; that the validity and finality of 
the release or consent is not affected by any 
separate agreement between the parent or guardian 
and the agency or prospective adoptive parent; that 
the parent or guardian understands that it serves the 
welfare of the child to keep the agency, DSS, or 
court informed of any health problems that the 
parent develops which could affect the child, and to 
keep his or her address current with the agency so 
that future inquiries on medical or social history 
could be answered. 

Payment of expenses. The law now requires a 
prospective adoptive parent to notify the court of 
any consideration paid or thing of value exchanged 
in connection with the adoption, and the court may 
approve or disapprove fees and expenses. The bill 
would instead specify a number of expenses that the 
adoptive parent could pay, and allow the court to 
approve payment for other services not listed; the 
sums would continue to be subject to court 
approval. A payment authorized by the bill could 
not be made contingent on a placement, release, or 
consent to adoption, nor on cooperation in the 
completion of the adoption. If an anticipated 
adoption was not completed, the person who had 
made the payments could not be reimbursed for 
them. Various documents accounting for and 
confirming any payments would have to be filed 
with the court at least seven days before formal 
court-approved placement of the child, and they 
would have to be updated at least 21 days before 
entry of the fmal order of adoption. 

Specifically-allowed expenses would be: agency 
services; medical expenses incurred in connection 
with the birth or any illness of the adoptee; 
counseling for a parent, guardian, or the adoptee; 
living expenses for the mother before the birth of 
the child and for up to six weeks after the birth; 
expenses incurred in compiling required information 
on an adoptee and his or her biological family; 
court costs and legal fees, including legal services 
performed for a biological parent or guardian; travel 
expenses or other expenses necessitated by the 
adoption; and preparation of a preplacement 

assessment and any court -ordered adoption 
investigation. 

A first-time violation of the provisions on payment 
of expenses would be a misdemeanor punishable by 
up to 90 days in jail, a fine of up to $1()0, or both. 
A subsequent violation would be a felony punishable 
by imprisonment for up to four years, a fine of up 
to $2,000, or both. The court could enjoin a 
violator from further violations. 

Placing agencies: disclosures. An adoption agency 
would have to give any individual who inquired 
about its services a written statement that described 
the types of children to be placed, eligibility 
requirements for adoptive families, services provided 
during the adoption process, the procedure for 
selecting a prospective adoptive parent (including 
the role of the child's parent or guardian in the 
process), the extent to which the agency permits or 
encourages exchange of identifying information or 
contact between biological and adoptive families, 
any post-release and post-finalization services 
provided, and a schedule of any fee(s). The 
statement also would have to note that each party to 
an adoption bad the right to independent 
representation by an attorney and that the agency 
could not provide adoption services to a minor 
parent unless that minor parent was represented by 
an attorney. 

Agency roles. In an agency placement, the adoption 
agency or the DSS could involve the parent or 
guardian of the child in the selection of an adoptive 
parent, and could facilitate the exchange of 
identifying information or meetings between a birth 
parent and an adoptive parent ( some agencies do 
this now). In addition, an adoption agency could 
assist a parent or guardian in making a direct 
placement. A parent or guardian could authorize 
an adoption agency to make a temporary placement 
under the bill. The authorization would have to be 
in writing and witnessed, and if the parent of the 
child being placed was an unemancipated minor, the 
document would also have to be signed by the 
parent or guardian of that minor parent. 

Adoption solicitation, placement. Only a 
prospective adoptive parent could solicit biological 
parents or guardians of potential adoptees for the 
purposes of adoption. Only a biological parent, a 
guardian, or an adoption agency with legal and 
physical custody of a child could solicit adoptive 
parents. ("Solicit" here would mean a 
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communication directed to a specific person; it 
would not include public communications not aimed 
at specific individuals.) Only a custodial parent, a 
guardian, an adoption agency, the DSS, or the court 
could place a child for adoption. A first-time 
violation of either of these restrictions would be a 
misdemeanor punishable by up to 90 days in jail, a 
fine of up to $100, or both. A subsequent violation 
would be a felony punishable by imprisonment for 
up to four years, a fine of up to $2,000, or both. 
The court could enjoin a violator from further 
violations. 

Legal representation. An adoption agency would be 
forbidden from providing adoption services to a 
minor parent unless that parent had obtained 
independent representation by an attorney. An 
attorney or law firm would be prohibited from 
providing legal services to both a parent or guardian 
and a prospective adoptive parent. 

Tie-bars. House Bill 4200 is tie-barred to House 
Bill 4201 and two bills that have not yet been 
introduced. 

House Bill 4428 would amend the adoption code 
(MCL 710.27 et al.) to accommodate direct consent 
adoptions in provisions on obtaining and 
maintaining identifying and nonidentifying 
information on adoptions, to expand on the 
nonidentifying information that must be compiled 
and maintained on an adoptee, and to provide for 
the exchange of information (through the DSS 
central registry) between adult adoptees and adult 
former siblings (i.e., biological siblings), and to 
clarify procedures under which information is 
requested and released through the DSS central 
registry. (Note: the adoption code distinguishes 
between identifying and nonidentifying information. 
Nonidentifying information is relatively freely 
available to affected parties, while various 
restrictions apply to the release of identifying 
information. Those restrictions vary according to 
the time the adoption occurred. A major revision 
of the adoption code occurred in 1980, and the law 
carries a presumption in favor of release of 
information on adoptions occurring after that time.) 

Nonidentifying information: duties. The law at 
present requires an adoption agency, the DSS, or a 
court placing an adoptee to maintain certain 
nonidentifying information, if obtainable. Under the 
bill, the court would maintain the information on a 
child adopted under a direct consent adoption, and 

the biological parent ( or guardian) would have to 
provide the information to the court before 
termination of parental rights. In addition, before 
a child was placed for adoption, the parent or 
guardian, adoption agency, DSS, or placing court 
would have to compile and provide to the 
prospective adoptive parent a written document 
containing all of the specified information 
reasonably obtainable from the parents, relatives, 
and guardian of the child, from any person who has 
had physical custody of the child for at least 30 
days, and from any other person who has provided 
health, psychological, educational, or other services 
to the child. Required nonidentifying information 
that was unobtainable before temporary placement 
would have to be submitted by the time of formal 
placement if reasonably obtainable. 

Required nonidentifying information. The bill 
would replace the current list of required 
nonidentifying information with more detailed 
descriptions of the sort of information desired. For 
example, "medical history of the adoptee and 
biological parents" would be replaced with a 
requirement for an account of the medical and 
genetic history of the child, including: prenatal 
care; medical condition at birth; drugs and 
medication taken by the mother during pregnancy; 
any medical, psychological, or dental examinations 
and diagnoses; any abuse suffered by the child; any 
reports concerning the child prepared by protective 
services, foster care, or adoption workers; and an 
immunization record for the child. Also required 
would be an account of the health and genetic 
history of the child's biological family as prescnbed 
by the bill. 

Newly included would be information on the 
following:· the child's educational performance and 
needs; a general description of the child's parents, 
including their ages and the length of time they had 
been married; an account of the child's past and 
existing relationship with any person with whom the 
child had lived or visited on a regular basis, together 
with the names and addresses of all foster parents, 
relatives, institutions, and facilities where the child 
had been placed; details on the child's family, 
including educational, professional, athletic, or 
artistic achievement, and any hobbies or special 
interests; any felony conviction of a parent and the 
circumstances of any termination of parental rights 
for abuse or neglect; the length of time between the 
termination of parental rights and adoptive 
placement, and whether termination was voluntary 
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or court-ordered; and, any information necessary to 
determine the child's eligibility for state or federal 
benefits. 

In-family adoptions. Adoption agencies, the courts, 
and the DSS would no longer have to maintain 
identifying and nonidentifying information on 
stepparent and in-family adoptions. 

Adult former siblings. The bill would authorize an 
adult biological sibling who knew an adoptee's birth 
name to file a statement with the DSS consenting to 
the release of his or her name and address to the 
adoptee; the statement could be filed, updated, or 
revoked at any time. An adult biological sibling 
could file a statement with the DSS that a biological 
parent had died; evidence of the death would have 
to be attached to the statement. (Under current 
law, restrictions on the release of identifying 
information on a parent are lifted when that parent 
dies.) An adult former sibling would no longer be 
entitled to nonidentifying information on an 
adoptee, although he or she could continue to 
obtain the identity of the court that confirmed the 
adoption, and the identity of the agency, court, or 
department to which the child had been committed. 

Adult adoptees: descendants. The bill would specify 
that all information to which an adult adoptee was 
entitled would be released to the adoptee's direct 
descendants, if the adoptee was deceased. 

Tie-bars. House Bill 4428 contains no tie-bars. It 
could take effect irrespective of whether any other 
bill was enacted. 

House Bill 41111 would amend the child care 
licensing act (MCL 722.124b) to require adoption 
agencies to submit annual reports to the 
Department of Social Services. A report would 
have to list every adoption the agency handled 
during the previous year, and for each adoption 
note the total amount charged and received, each 
service performed and its fee, and any other 
compensation or thing of value received by the 
agency. The bill contains no tie-bars; it could take 
effect whether or not any other bill was enacted. 

House Bill 4429 would amend the child care 
licensing act (MCL 722.111) to exempt adoption 
placements from foster home licensing 
requirements. The bill could not take effect unless 
House Bills 4200 and 4427 (which also would 

provide for direct placement adoptions) were 
enacted. 

FISCAL IMPLICATIONS: 

The House Fiscal Agency reports that a fiscal 
analysis is in process. (5-18-93} 

ARGUMENTS: 
• 

For: 
By providing for direct consent adoptions, the bills 
would ensure that birth parents, if they wish it, have 
the opportunity to select adoptive parents for their 
children, or to participate in the selection process to 
the degree that they prefer. Various safeguards 
would help to ensure that birth parents understood 
the legal and emotional consequences of giving 
children up for adoption, that adoptive parents were 
capable and prepared to accept the adoptee into 
their home, and that babies were not treated as an 
item of commerce. There would be an exhaustive 
home study conducted by a licensed adoption 
agency prior to a child being placed in the home of 
prospective adoptive parents; birth and adoptive 
rarents would have to have separate and 
mdependent legal counsel; reasonable counseling 
and legal expenses for birth parents would 
reimbursable by adoptive parents; and all expenses 
paid by the adoptive parents would be subject to 
requirements for detailed accounting and court 
approval. The bills would allow for adoptions that 
were emotionally healthier for all concerned, and 
put an end to urmecessary burdens of having to go 
to other states for adoptions. 

Against: 
Although providing for open or direct consent 
adoptions is not by itself objectionable, allowing the 
parties to bypass adoption agencies is. In allowing 
parties to an adoption to work with private 
attorneys. instead of nonprofit adoptioo agencies, 
House Bill 4200 would do a disservice to birth 
parents, adoptive parents, and children. Agencies 
not only have expertise in making good placements, 
but they offer continuing services such as counseling 
and advice, and they have a long-term commitment 
to making an adoption a success. With attorneys, 
on the other hand, there is a risk that pecuniary 
interests will conflict with the best interests of the 
child, and there is no continuity of services. 
Allowing attorneys to be adoption facilitators would 
open the process to fresh abuses and new problems. 
Ratlier than risk the consequences of attorney-
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assisted adoptions, it would be better to keep the 
system of agency-assisted adoptions and address 
concerns about some agencies' procedures through 
pursuing more selective reforms. After all, many, if 
not most, agencies in Michigan are providing 
adoptions where the birth parent(s) select the 
adoptive parent(s). In its attempt to address the 
abuses of a few agencies, House Bill 4200 would 
give rise to a system where adoption would no 
longer be only a nonprofit service where the 
paramount concern is the best interests of the child, 
but rather would be an industry. 
Response: 
There are no requirements for agencies to provide 
counseling and post-adoptive services now, and the 
quality of services provided vary widely, as does the 
quality in providing placement services. House Bill 
4200 at least would require parties to be informed 
of their options regarding counseling and allow 
adoptive parents to pay for birth parents' 
counseling. While it is likely that there would be 
the occasional ''bad apple" handling attorney-assisted 
adoptions, just as there is with agency adoptions, 
stories abound of adoptions that were botched or 
nearly so because of a lack of legal expertise. The 
complexity and importance of adoption proceedings 
are such that all parties should have legal 
representation; one should not leave the matter to 
adoption agencies. Perhaps most importantly, the 
bill is necessary because with the current system 
parties to an adoption have no guarantees that an 
adoption agency will honor promises to place a 
child where requested by the birth mother. 

Against: 
The legislation would make various demands of 
adoption agencies that also should be made of any 
person assisting an adoption. For example, 
adoption agencies would have to provide certain 
written statements in response to inquiries, and 
make annual reports to the Department of Social 
Services; such requirements also should apply to 
attorneys who facilitate adoptions. 

Against: 
House Bill 4200 would require preplacement 
assessments to be done by adoption agencies. This 
would be unduly restrictive, as there are many in 
the state with the necessary expertise to conduct 
home studies who may not at present be employed 
by an adoption agency. It would be better to do as 
earlier versions of the package proposed to do and 
provide for certification of adoption specialists who 
would thereby qualify to do home studies. 

Response: 
The requisite expertise for this critical element in 
the decision to place a child lies with adoption 
agencies. 

Against: 
The legislation may not adequately safeguard 
against abuses whereby babies in effect go to the 
highest bidder. Granted, a birth mother's expenses 
that were reimbursed by adoptive parents would 
have to be approved by the court, but in allowing so 
many expenses to be paid, the bills could pave the 
way for prospective adoptive parents who were 
more affluent than their competitors to buy a birth 
mother's favor. 

For: 
With the expansion of nonidentifying information to 
be developed and maintained on adoptions, the 
legislation would ensure that emotionally and 
medically important information was freely 
available. Details such as those proposed by House 
Bill 4428 would have a further advantage by 
ensuring that prospective adoptive parents were fully 
aware of what they were contemplating; with 
complete · information at the beginning of the 
adoption process, the tragedy of a disrupted 
adoption, where adoptive parents relinquish the 
child, should be avoidable. 

Against: 
Much of the information to be newly included as 
"nonidentifying information" comes very close to 
being identifying information that could aid an 
adoptee in searching for a birth parent who may not 
want to be found. For example, the information 
would include the names and addresses of foster 
parents and relatives with whom the child had lived. 

For: 
The importance of avoiding foster care and multiple 
placements for a child is widely recognized; 
uprooting children may engender a number of 
emotional and psychological problems for them and 
their adoptive families. However, prior to an 
adoption order, a child can be placed only in a 
licensed facility; thus, to avoid multiple placements 
for a child to be adopted, some adoption agencies 
have prospective adoptive parents get licensed as 
foster care homes, even though the placement is at 
the tlsk of a birth parent deciding against adoption 
and demanding the return of the child (reports are 
that snch a change of heart rarely occurs, however). 
The legislation would eliminate the unnecessary 
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burden of foster care licensure for prospective 
adoptive parents bringing a child into their home, 
providing the family received a favorable 
preplacement assessment; additional safeguards 
would ensure the family nnderstood that the birth 
parent could yet retrieve the child, and require that 
the placement was followed by either a petition to 
adopt or a return of the child to the parent or 
guardian. 

POSIDONS: 

Parents for Private Adoption/Family Tree supports 
the bills. (5-18-93) 

The Michigan Federation of Private Child and 
Family Agencies opposes a two-track system and 
supports open and direct consent adoption only 
within licensed nonprofit child placing agencies 
where acconntability, continuity of care, and a full 
range of services can be maintained. (5-11-93) 

Right to Life of Michigan opposes Honse Bill 4200. 
(5-18-93) 
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