
THE JUDGES RETIREMENT ACT OF 1992 (EXCERPT)
Act 234 of 1992

38.2302 Annual appropriation; determination and certification of amount.
Sec. 302. (1) Except as provided in subsection (2), the legislature shall annually appropriate to the

retirement system the amount determined under subsection (2) in order to fund the retirement system on an
estimated basis for the fiscal year for which the appropriation is made. The legislature shall annually
appropriate to the retirement system the amount determined under subsection (3) in order to reconcile the
estimated appropriation made in the previous fiscal year with the actual appropriation needed to adequately
fund the retirement system for the previous fiscal year.

(2) The legislature shall annually appropriate to the retirement system an amount equal to 3.5% of the
aggregate annual compensation or the difference between the sum of the contribution rates determined under
section 301(2) and (3) multiplied by the aggregate annual compensation and the estimated revenue from court
fees under section 304, whichever is greater. The department shall submit the amount determined under this
subsection in the executive budget to the legislature for appropriation in the next fiscal year. If the department
receives notification from the United States internal revenue service that this subsection will cause the
retirement system to be disqualified for tax purposes under the internal revenue code, this subsection does not
apply and subsection (4) applies.

(3) Not later than 60 days after the termination of each state fiscal year, the bureau of retirement systems
shall certify to the director of the department the actual aggregate annual compensation paid to all active
members during the preceding state fiscal year and the difference, if any, between the actual actuarial funding
requirement and the sum of the actual revenue received by the retirement system during the preceding fiscal
year from the appropriation pursuant to subsection (2) or (4), whichever is applicable, employer contributions
pursuant to section 303, court filing fees pursuant to section 304, and mandatory member contributions
pursuant to section 305. The department shall submit the amount determined under this subsection in the
executive budget to the legislature for appropriation in the next fiscal year.

(4) If applicable, the bureau of retirement systems in the department shall certify to the director of the
department an amount equal to the difference between the estimated actuarial funding requirement for the
next fiscal year and the sum of the estimated revenue to be received by the retirement system during the next
fiscal year from employer contributions pursuant to section 303, court fees pursuant to section 304, and
mandatory member contributions pursuant to section 305. The department shall submit the amount
determined under this subsection in the executive budget to the legislature for appropriation in the next fiscal
year.

History: 1992, Act 234, Eff. Mar. 31, 1993.
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